

# Past Sheriff Sale List

Tuesday, December 30, 2014

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
01/02/14	13CV0309	Bell	147 South Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$12,000.00	\$8,000.00	Plaintiff	\$17,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0280	Boos	1116 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$50,000.00	\$33,334.00	Plaintiff	\$33,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0303	Breaux	304 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$29,000.00	\$19,334.00	Plaintiff	\$24,650.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0239	Cogar	82 1st Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	Plaintiff	\$20,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0252	Czapski	205 North US 23, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,205.29	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0257	Fouts	732 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	12CV0202	Frankart	134 Rock Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$24,000.00	\$16,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0270	Klotz	222 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,457.29	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0250	Redick	721 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,382.22	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0139	Rettig	385 South Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$50,000.00	\$33,334.00	Fifth Third Mortgage Company	\$33,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0234	Scherger	717 South Wood Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,655.17	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	13CV0264	Stoker	145 Nichols Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,217.84	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/02/14	12CV0131	West	691 North State Route 587, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
01/16/14	13CV0158	Baker	103 Broadway Street, Republic, Ohio 44867	\$70,000.00	\$46,667.00	Plaintiff	\$59,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	13CV0252	Czapski	205 North US 23, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,205.29	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	13CV0288	Fuerstenau	719 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,514.89	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	13CV0288	Fuerstenau	0 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,957.88	Calvin L. Tressler and Christine A. Tressler	\$1,957.88	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	13CV0288	Fuerstenau	0 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$2,929.62	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	12CV0103	Hess	73 Ella Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$31,000.00	\$20,667.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	12CV0444	Martinez	839 Leonard Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$16,000.00	\$10,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	12CV0141	Orpurt	1205 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$58,000.00	\$38,667.00	Plaintiff	\$38,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	13CV0044	Perry	168 Erie Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$26,000.00	\$17,334.00	Plaintiff	\$18,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	13CV0234	Scherger	717 South Wood Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,655.17	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/16/14	13CV0264	Stoker	145 Nichols Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,217.84	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/30/14	13CV0288	Fuerstenau	719 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,514.89	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/30/14	13CV0288	Fuerstenau	0 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$2,929.62	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0288	Fuerstenau	0 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,957.88	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
01/30/14	12CV0184	Koch	1998 Fleetwood Manufactured Home located at the address of 686 South Sandusky Street, Lot 86, Tiffin, Ohio		\$12,724.64	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/30/14	12CV0194	Lear	180 North State Route 587, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$78,000.00	\$52,000.00	Plaintiff	\$52,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/30/14	12CV0409	Phounsavath	723 Glenwood Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$26,000.00	\$17,334.00	Plaintiff	\$42,789.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/30/14	13CV0289	Shackelford	644 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,600.00	\$24,400.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0259	Stover	94 Coe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883			N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	12CV0433	Vanover	182 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$10,837.47	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
02/13/14	12CV0184	Koch	1998 Fleetwood Manufactured Home located at the address of 686 South Sandusky Street, Lot 86, Tiffin, Ohio		\$12,724.64	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
02/13/14	13CV0112	Palmer	450 Colonial Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$24,000.00	\$16,000.00	Vicki M. Burns	\$27,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0235	Salas	1737 East County Road 51, Old Fort, Ohio 44861	\$9,000.00	\$6,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	12CV0433	Vanover	182 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$10,837.47			<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0138	Bauer	199 Huss Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0366	Bullock	911 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
02/27/14	13CV0349	Clifton	351 East Eagle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$4,851.01	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0257	Fouts	732 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
	13CV0160	Harris	114 North US Highway 23 and North US Highway 23, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
02/27/14	13CV0077	Moore	444 South Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$78,000.00	\$52,000.00	Plaintiff	\$52,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
02/27/14	13CV0271	Nye	95 Second Ave., Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$8,162.03	Wayne A. Kipps	\$17,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
02/27/14	13CV0344	Wildman	8371 West County Road 28, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,034.57	Jonathan and Tracy Moore	\$8,034.57	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/13/14	13CV0349	Clifton	351 East Eagle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$4,851.01	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/13/14	13CV0380	DeWeese	4624 West US 224, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0310	Dorsey	306 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/13/14	13CV0354	Dunn	240 Union Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$31,000.00	\$20,667.00	Richard A. Kahler	\$20,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0311	Kackley	1370 North Main Street South Building, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/13/14	13CV0324	Marks	3508 North State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$65,000.00	\$43,334.00	Plaintiff	\$43,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0271	Nye	95 Second Ave., Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$8,162.03		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/13/14	13CV0258	Pierce	1815 South Winfield Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$120,000.00	\$80,000.00	Plaintiff	\$115,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/13/14	13CV0036	Wall	2564 South Township Road 197, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$78,000.00	\$52,000.00	Plaintiff	\$52,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0344	Wildman	8371 West County Road 28, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,034.57		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
03/27/14	13CV0351	Ferguson	214 Bannister Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,535.56	Tracy A. Ickes	\$6,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/27/14	12CV0202	Frankart	134 Rock Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$24,000.00	\$16,000.00	Nicholas J. Frankart	\$20,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/27/14	13CV0298	Gibson	65 Virginia Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$9,885.01	Douglas P. Swartzmiller	\$18,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/27/14	13CV0316	Hall, Jr.	122 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,899.76	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0350	Kilen	0 Johnson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$2,735.10	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/27/14	13CV0314	Myers	139 Wentz Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0289	Shackelford	644 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,600.00	\$24,400.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/27/14	13CV0259	Stover	94 Coe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	Plaintiff	\$28,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0351	Ferguson	214 Bannister Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,535.56		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0298	Gibson	65 Virginia Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$9,885.01		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
04/10/14	13CV0316	Hall, Jr.	122 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,899.76	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0350	Kilen	0 Johnson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$2,735.10	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
04/10/14	12CV0238	Spahr, Jr.	34 Oil Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	Plaintiff	\$28,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0075	Vitt	445 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$17,000.00	\$11,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
04/24/14	13CV0374	Benavides	8912 State Road 590, Bettsville, Ohio 44815-0016	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	Plaintiff	\$26,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/24/14	13CV0415	Brendle	1040 Cory Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	Plaintiff	\$28,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/24/14	13CV0366	Bullock	911 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	Plaintiff	\$14,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0361	Craley	124 Seneca Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830-3154	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0321	Lachner	499 Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$58,000.00	\$38,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
04/24/14	13CV0404	Schock	833 North Waters Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	Plaintiff	\$50,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/24/14	13CV0376	Stallard	524 South Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	Plaintiff	\$36,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/24/14	13CV0336	Waltermyer	1212 42nd Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	Plaintiff	\$14,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/24/14	13CV0019	Wilmoth	822 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	12CV0305	Baker	511 West Jefferson Street, Republic, Ohio 44867	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0355	Bricker	5191 Township Road 81, Bellevue, Ohio 44811	\$105,000.00	\$70,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	13CV0025	Coppus	432 Stadium Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	Plaintiff	\$32,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	13CV0356	Daughenbaugh	192 Hall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	13CV0380	DeWeese	4624 West US 224, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
05/08/14	13CV0407	Miller	356 West Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$10,807.81	Jaclyn C. Schalk	\$15,300.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	13CV0315	Noel	227 East South Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$9,000.00	\$6,000.00	Plaintiff	\$6,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	13CV0431	Perna	44 Virginia Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$28,000.00	\$18,667.00	Plaintiff	\$18,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	12CV0063	Roush	6935 South State Route 100, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	Plaintiff	\$28,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	13CV0405	Sheridan	144 East Jones, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$10,888.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/08/14	13CV0386	Wolph	845 Cory Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$13,745.84	Gilbert Tellez	\$13,745.84	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/22/14	13CV0307	Cooper	724 Oaklawn Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	Plaintiff	\$22,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/22/14	14CV0026	Crawford	133 Hunter Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$34,500.00	\$23,000.00	Plaintiff	\$80,609.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/22/14	12CV0441	Hussey	6355 North County Road 29, Bellevue, Ohio 44811	\$40,000.00	\$26,667.00	Plaintiff	\$26,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/22/14	13CV0347	Jones	8611 Township Road 32, Clyde, Ohio 43421	\$10,000.00	\$6,667.00	Kevin M. Williams	\$19,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0311	Kackley	1370 North Main Street South Building, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
05/22/14	13CV0296	Lewis	47 Walker Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$44,000.00	\$29,334.00	Plaintiff	\$53,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0407	Miller	356 West Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$10,807.81	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
05/22/14	13CV0405	Sheridan	144 East Jones, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$10,888.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
	13CV0386	Wolph	845 Cory Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$13,745.84	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0052	Amlin	184 East Tecumseh Trail, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$125,000.00	\$83,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/05/14	13CV0294	Burkett	140 West 6th Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	Plaintiff	\$16,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0412	Drown	0 Washington Street, Republic, Ohio 44867		\$2,816.61	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0412	Drown	506 Washington Street, Republic, Ohio 44867		\$10,364.96	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0257	Fouts	732 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/05/14	13CV0406	Hammer	928 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$32,000.00	\$21,334.00	Plaintiff	\$21,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/05/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	405 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,874.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/05/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	0 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,821.87	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/05/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	403 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,523.81	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/05/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	356 North Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,691.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/05/14	13CV0379	McElhatten	2261 South township Road 159, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	Plaintiff	\$78,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0235	Salas	1737 East County 51, Old Fort, Ohio 44861	\$9,000.00	\$6,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0040	Stockmeister	30 North Seneca, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$70,000.00	\$46,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>



Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
06/05/14	14CV0036	Stonecrest Investments	147 East Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,092.18	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	14CV0008	B&H-Farm Rentals	122 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$15,472.66	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	14CV0008	B&H-Farm Rentals	116 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,146.40	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0369	Beekman	18 North Maple Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$13,000.00	\$8,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0412	Drown	0 Washington Street, Republic, Ohio 44867		\$2,816.61	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0412	Drown	506 Washington Street, Republic, Ohio 44867		\$10,364.96	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	0 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,821.87	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	356 North Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,691.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	405 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,874.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	14CV0009	J&F Rentals	403 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,523.81	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	12CV0324	Slemmer	1300 West County Road 6, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$22,000.00	\$14,667.00	Plaintiff	\$14,740.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	14CV0036	Stonecrest Investments	147 East Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,092.18	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	13CV0414	Weisenauer	292 West Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	Plaintiff	\$22,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/19/14	08CV0136	Wise	1041 Gerlock Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$58,000.00	\$38,667.00	Plaintiff	\$100,300.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
07/03/14	14CV0055	Alexander	327 Elm Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$28,000.00	\$18,667.00	Plaintiff	\$18,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	14CV0079	Ash	727 Circle Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44030	\$24,000.00	\$16,000.00	Plaintiff	\$16,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	14CV0008	B&H-Farm Rentals	122 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$15,472.66	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	14CV0008	B&H-Farm Rentals	116 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,146.40	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	13CV0138	Bauer	199 Huss Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	Plaintiff	\$48,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	14CV0066	Fish	0 East Eagle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,086.99	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	14CV0054	Frankart	146 Summit Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$38,000.00	\$25,334.00	Plaintiff	\$25,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	14CV0058	Heckathorn	739 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$61,500.00	\$41,000.00	Plaintiff	\$41,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	13CV0394	Hoerig	280 West Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$22,000.00	\$14,667.00	Plaintiff	\$14,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0321	Lachner	499 Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$58,000.00	\$38,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	13CV0364	Pearson	430 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$12,534.31	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0033	Rublaitus	376 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$16,500.00	\$11,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
07/03/14	13CV0395	Schuld	1404 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$10,480.95	Abel & Guadalupe G. Garcia	\$12,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0022	Schwochow	4169 East County Road 50, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$84,000.00	\$56,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
07/03/14	14CV0038	Weber	366 Hedges Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$64,500.00	\$43,000.00	Plaintiff	\$43,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	13CV0004	Chapman	50 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$42,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	14CV0066	Fish	0 East Eagle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,086.99	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	14CV0098	Garn	110 State Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815	\$46,000.00	\$30,667.00	Plaintiff	\$30,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	13CV0320	Hernandez	221 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	Plaintiff	\$16,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	14CV0105	Newsome	8945 North Township Road 32, Clyde, Ohio 43410		\$8,020.02	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	14CV0043	Parks	716 Glenwood Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$43,000.00	\$28,667.00	Plaintiff	\$28,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	13CV0364	Pearson	430 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$12,534.31	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	14CV0093	Simpkins	308 Wall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$49,000.00	\$32,667.00	Plaintiff	\$32,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	13CV0327	Smith	389 Circular Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$56,000.00	\$37,334.00	Plaintiff	\$37,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	13CV0322	Spencer	207 South Broadway Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836		\$7,230.06	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	13CV0322	Spencer	209 South Broadway Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836		\$8,385.30	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/17/14	13CV0322	Spencer	407 West Adams, Green Springs, Ohio 44836		\$28,233.46	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0075	Vitt	445 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$17,000.00	\$11,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
07/31/14	13CV0135	Hacker	8157 East Township Road 58, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$4,500.00	\$3,000.00	Plaintiff	\$8,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0117	Kuzma	250 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
07/31/14	14CV0105	Newsome	8945 North Township Road 32, Clyde, Ohio 43410		\$8,020.02	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/31/14	13CV0397	Orwick	142 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/31/14	13CV0422	Rumschlag	21 East Tiffin Street, New Riegel, Ohio 44853	\$29,000.00	\$19,334.00	Plaintiff	\$19,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/31/14	12CV0446	Scholidon	816 Eastern Ave., Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/31/14	13CV0322	Spencer	207 South Broadway Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836		\$7,230.06	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/31/14	13CV0322	Spencer	407 West Adams, Green Springs, Ohio 44836		\$28,233.46	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/31/14	13CV0322	Spencer	209 South Broadway Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836		\$8,385.30	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0113	Vera	3553 South Township Road 165, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$78,000.00	\$52,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
08/14/14	14CV0115	Broadbent	16101 County Road 32, Bellevue, Ohio 44811	\$149,000.00	\$99,334.00	Plaintiff	\$99,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/14/14	14CV0061	Coppus	O South State Route 231, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	Brian Smith	\$20,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/14/14	14CV0089	Funk	322 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$2,806.06	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/14/14	14CV0089	Funk	0 Sandusky Street and 205 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,468.75	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
08/14/14	13CV0335	Magnus	6035 North US Highway 23, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$49,500.00	\$33,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	14CV0027	Blakley	11151 West County Road 10, Alvada, Ohio 44802	\$53,000.00	\$35,334.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	13CV0361	Craley	124 Seneca Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830-3154	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	Plaintiff	\$22,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	13CV0380	DeWeese	4624 West US 224, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$15,302.67	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0257	Fouts	732 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	14CV0089	Funk	0 Sandusky Street and 205 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,468.75	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	14CV0089	Funk	322 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$2,806.06	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0133	Halcomb	316 Sullivan Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815	\$80,000.00	\$53,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	13CV0332	Hoover	181 Hall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$55,000.00	\$36,667.00	Plaintiff	\$36,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	14CV0059	Jackson	15 North High Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818		\$5,968.69	Herman J. Kinn	\$5,968.69	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	14CV0059	Jackson	0 North High Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818		\$1,887.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	13CV0346	Nye	610 and 0 Columbus Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	13CV0346	Nye	113 and 113 1/2 North Union, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$24,000.00	\$16,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	13CV0346	Nye	301 Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
08/28/14	13CV0346	Nye	525 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$27,000.00	\$18,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/28/14	13CV0381	Smelser	7825 Fort Street, Old Fort, Ohio 44861	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$66,612.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0378	Fitch	179 Circular Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/11/14	14CV0074	Gregg	301 State Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815	\$27,000.00	\$18,000.00	Old Fort Banking Company	\$18,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/11/14	14CV0059	Jackson	0 North High Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818		\$1,887.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0059	Jackson	15 North High Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818		\$5,968.69	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0139	Lewis	2889 West US Highway 224, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/11/14	12CV0230	Stock	7117 North County Road 33, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	Plaintiff	\$44,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0075	Vitt	445 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$17,000.00	\$11,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/25/14	14CV0132	Dorsey	1304 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,724.19	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/25/14	14CV0057	Holmer	214 North Liberty, Attica Ohio 44807		\$7,253.20	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/25/14	12CV0322	Huffman	44 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$45,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/25/14	13CV0321	Lachner	499 Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$58,000.00	\$38,667.00	Plaintiff	\$38,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/09/14	12CV0305	Baker	511 West Jefferson Street, Republic, Ohio 44867	\$23,500.00	\$15,667.00	Plaintiff	\$20,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
10/09/14	14CV0138	Bohlen	629 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$31,000.00	\$20,667.00	Plaintiff	\$20,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/09/14	14CV0132	Dorsey	1304 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,724.19	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0310	Dorsey	306 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0146	Gill	12 West Ellen Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0136	Hickey	403 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830			N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/09/14	14CV0057	Holmer	214 North Liberty, Attica Ohio 44807		\$7,253.20	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/09/14	14CV0145	Lofton	27 Ella Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$52,500.00	\$35,000.00	Plaintiff	\$35,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0235	Salas	1737 East County 51, Old Fort, Ohio 44861	\$9,000.00	\$6,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/09/14	14CV0005	Shook	108 South Woodwind Drive, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$55,000.00	\$36,667.00	Plaintiff	\$36,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0037	Theis	2922 East County Road 50, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$49,000.00	\$32,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0180	Dull	148 East Township Road 152, Tiffin, Ohio 44883			N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	14CV0027	Blakley	11151 West County Road 10, Alvada, Ohio 44802	\$53,000.00	\$35,334.00	Plaintiff	\$35,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	14CV0112	Correll	222 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,787.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	13CV0104	Custer	674 Maple Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$12,000.00	\$8,000.00	Plaintiff	\$8,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
11/06/14	13CV0306	Hanna	219 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$47,000.00	\$31,334.00	Plaintiff	\$31,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	14CV0028	Kirk	404 East Tiffin Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$22,000.00	\$14,667.00	Plaintiff	\$14,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	13CV0335	Magnus	6035 North US Highway 23, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$49,500.00	\$33,000.00	Plaintiff	\$39,111.51	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	14CV0170	Nye	949 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$37,000.00	\$24,667.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	13CV0055	Rhodes	368 Perry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$49,000.00	\$32,667.00	Plaintiff	\$32,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	14CV0161	Scherf	15442 East State Route 162, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$32,500.00	\$21,667.00	Plaintiff	\$21,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	14CV0196	Scherger	70 Bryden Road, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$80,000.00	\$53,334.00	Plaintiff	\$53,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	13CV0005	Smith	662 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$20,000.00	\$13,334.00	Plaintiff	\$39,900.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	14CV0113	Vera	3553 South Township Road 165, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$78,000.00	\$52,000.00	Plaintiff	\$52,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/06/14	12CV0131	West	691 North State Route 587, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$22,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/20/14	14CV0112	Correll	222 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,787.57	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/20/14	11CV0378	Fitch	179 Circular Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	Plaintiff	\$26,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/20/14	13CV0117	Kuzma	250 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$11,000.00	\$7,334.00	Plaintiff	\$12,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/20/14	14CV0022	Schwochow	4169 East County Road 50, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$84,000.00	\$56,000.00	Plaintiff	\$90,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>



Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
11/20/14	14CV0153	Walter	752 Eastern Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	Plaintiff	\$20,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/04/14	13CV0257	Fouts	732 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/04/14	13CV0137	Fuller	365 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	Plaintiff	\$93,452.67	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/04/14	14CV0229	Hoyda	33 Schonhardt Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$70,000.00	\$46,667.00	Plaintiff	\$46,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	13CV0370	Mabry	57 Grace Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/04/14	13CV0274	Salazar	439 East Tiffin Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/18/14	14CV0160	Correll	1797 East Township Road 122, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$110,000.00	\$73,334.00	Plaintiff	\$73,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/18/14	14CV0221	Edwards	915 Spruce Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$17,000.00	\$11,334.00	Plaintiff	\$11,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/18/14	14CV0232	Greer	214 South Kansas Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	Plaintiff	\$36,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/18/14	14CV0210	Harple	217 Hudson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883-1423	\$55,000.00	\$36,667.00	C William Harple	\$55,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0102	Mongeau	410 North Street, Republic, Ohio 44867	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	14CV0190	Russell	31 Jefferson Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/18/14	14CV0091	Teeters	115 Westwood Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$96,000.00	\$64,000.00	Richard W. DeWald, Trust	\$85,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>