Past Sheriff Sale List By Date

Original Sale Date

5/26/2011

Case Caption

11CV0029 - Wells Fargo vs. Anderson

10CV0586 - Wells Fargo vs. Bernal

10CV0629 - SC Treasurer vs. Corliss

11CV0013 - SC Treasurer vs. Faith in Christ Tab.

10CV0593 - Huntington vs. Fortney

11CV0059 - Huntington vs. Garcia

11CV0059 - Huntington vs. Garcia

10CV0625 - SC Treasurer vs. Hamilton

11CV0075 - Wells Fargo vs. Hartsel

10CV0601 - SC Treasurer vs. Hooven

10CV0530 - HSBC Mortg vs. Lofay

11CV0012 - SC Treasurer vs. Mendez

10CV0367 - BAC Home Loans vs. Mosier

Legal Address

406 North Main Street, Attica, Ohio 44807

926 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

154 East Township Road 1178, Tiffin, Ohio

44883

33 Venice Street, Attica, Ohio 44807

343 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883

847 Spruce Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

847 Spruce Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

2460 North County Road 27 (Seneca East

LSD), Attica, Ohio 44807

269 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883

165 East Center Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

266 Wentz Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883

399 Fall Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

508 South Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio
44830

Appraisal

Amount

$48,000.00

$57,000.00

$29,000.00

$29,000.00

$60,000.00

$63,000.00

$43,000.00

Purchaser

Plaintiff

N/A

N/A

No Bid No Sale

Plaintiff

Plaintiff

Plaintiff

No Bid No Sale

Plaintiff

No Bid No Sale

Plaintiff

N/A

Plaintiff

Purchase
Price

$32,000.00

$-00

$-00

$-00

$38,000.00

$19,334.00

$19,334.00

$-00

$40,000.00

$-00

$42,000.00

$-00

$28,667.00

Note

Sale cancelled by court order filed
April 12, 2011.

Sale Cancelled by Court Order filed
May 24, 2011.

Second sale attempt.

Sale cancelled by court order filed
April 28, 2011.



10CV0598 - SC Treasurer vs. Nungester

642 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

No Bid No Sale

$-00

Second sale attempt.

11CV0032 - CitiMortgage vs. Welborn

230 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830

$25,000.00

Plaintiff

$16,667.00




