
Past Sheriff Sale List Friday, July 23, 2010

Date of
Sale

Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
Amount

Purchaser Purchase
Price

Sale
Cancelled

08/20/09 09CV0026 Parkins 7245 South County Road 43, Bloomville, Ohio $90,000.00 Charles P. and Kimberly A. 
Groth

$60,000.00

09/03/09 08CV0422 Company 167 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio $85,000.00 Plaintiff $56,667.00

09/03/09 09CV0200 McGough 339 West Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio $65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00

09CV0109 Harper 135 Tomb Street, Tiffin, Ohio $60,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0315 Helkey 35 Huss Street, Tiffin, Ohio $72,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0063 Singell 10840 West State Route 18, Fostoria, Ohio $89,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0210 Zender 525 Bulger Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio $24,000.00 N/A $-00

08CV0371 Downey, Sr. 819 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $47,500.00 N/A $-00

08CV0618 Gannon 735 Spruce Street, Fostoria, Ohio $27,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0312 Hamner 107 West Adams Street, Green Springs, Ohio $73,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0047 Hartsel/Welly 5859 Poplar Street, Bascom, Ohio $26,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0377 Kuhn 912 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio $33,000.00 N/A $-00

10/15/09 07CV0199 Marshall 321 Elm Street, Fostoria, Ohio $46,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00

09CV0242 Morgart/Mogart 966 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio $75,000.00 N/A $-00

10/15/09 09CV0270 Ramsey, Jr. 335 College Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio $56,000.00 Plaintiff $37,333.00



Date of
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Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
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Purchaser Purchase
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Sale
Cancelled

08CV0428 Stearns 339 West North Street, Fostoria, Ohio $50,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0393 Altenburger 2621 South State Route 100, Tiffin, Ohio $152,000.00 N/A $-00

10/29/09 09CV0126 Arrendondo 739 Circle Drive, Fostoria, Ohio $5,000.00 Plaintiff $10,500.00

10/29/09 09CV0081 Bare 60 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00

09CV0059 Dean & Donna's Convenience 
Store, Ltd.

840 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio $47,000.00 N/A $-00

10/29/09 09CV0360 Evans 139 East Center Street, Fostoria, Ohio $36,000.00 Plaintiff $24,000.00

09CV0017 Gannon 200 Third Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio N/A $-00

07CV0103 Hartson 6375 West Country Road 6, New Riegel, Ohio $26,000.00 N/A $-00

10/29/09 09CV0365 Hoffman/Nichol 505 East Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio $75,000.00 Plaintiff $50,000.00

08CV0636 Kohlenberg 251 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio $79,000.00 N/A $-00

10/29/09 09CV0335 Larcey 124-126 South Broadway Street, Green 
Springs, Ohio

$33,000.00 Matthew S. Glick $22,000.00

09CV0141 Perry 31 East New Haven Street, Bloomville, Ohio $49,000.00 N/A $-00

10/29/09 09CV0005 See 16702 Township Road 178, Bellevue, Ohio $162,000.00 Plaintiff $148,000.00

10/29/09 09CV0285 Smith 12070 West County Road 10, Alvada, Ohio $15,000.00 Plaintiff $66,577.63

10/29/09 09CV0372 Tew, Sr. 38 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio $99,000.00 Plaintiff $66,000.00

09CV0078 Zimmerman 199 Charlotte Street, Tiffin, Ohio $63,000.00 N/A $-00
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11/12/09 09CV0038 Booth 5116 South State Route 4, Attica, Ohio $79,000.00 Plaintiff $52,667.00

09CV0287 Cardwell 824 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio $68,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0314 Clifton 188 Huss Street, Tiffin, Ohio $63,000.00 N/A $-00

11/12/09 09CV0410 Cook 1770 West County Road 38, Tiffin, Ohio $50,000.00 Plaintiff $37,000.00

11/12/09 09CV0277 D'Angelo 104 Center Street, Tiffin, Ohio $39,000.00 Plaintiff $33,000.00

11/12/09 08CV0537 Doane 831 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $42,000.00 Plaintiff $48,000.00

11/12/09 09CV0017 Gannon 200 Third Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $27,000.00 Plaintiff $18,000.00

09CV0376 Gillian 515 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio $36,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0408 Greene 169 Noble Street, Tiffin, Ohio $59,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0403 Salaz 1416 North Township Road 21, Fostoria, Ohio $58,000.00 N/A $-00

11/12/09 09CV0299 Vanhoose 1023 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $18,000.00 Plaintiff $12,000.00

09CV0264 Vitte 148 East Eagle Street, Fostoria, Ohio $65,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0393 Altenburger 2621 South State Route 100, Tiffin, Ohio $152,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0394 Bollinger 7291 State Route 269 North, Bellevue, Ohio $85,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0346 Brommer, Jr. 3478 South State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio $99,000.00 N/A $-00

12/10/09 08CV0569 Carter 130 West Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio $49,000.00 Plaintiff $32,667.00
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12/10/09 09CV0265 Cook 10388 West Township Road 84, Fostoria, Ohio $125,000.00 Plaintff $83,333.33

12/10/09 09CV0411 Fearing 659 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio $32,000.00 Joseph A. Theis and Robert E. 
Theis

$21,500.00

12/10/09 09CV0479 Gannon/Taylor 958 South Bon Air Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $37,000.00 Plaintiff $28,000.00

09CV0318 Grine 4350 North County Road 25, Fostoria, Ohio $100,000.00 N/A $-00

12/10/09 08CV0598 Hossler, Sr. 535 Gormley Street, Fostoria, Ohio $13,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00

12/10/09 09CV0322 Hoy 3014 East State Route 18, Tiffin, Ohio $107,000.00 Plaintiff $71,333.00

12/10/09 09CV0262 Hunter 1695 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio $20,000.00 Plaintff $13,333.00

12/10/09 09CV0419 Kessler 712 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio $33,000.00 Thomas A. Tiell $22,000.00

12/10/09 09CV0419 Kessler 652 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio $25,000.00 Plaintiff $16,667.00

12/10/09 09CV0349 Kimble 674 North Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio $18,000.00 Plaintiff $63,796.64

12/10/09 08CV0636 Kohlenberg 251 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio $79,000.00 Plaintiff $56,000.00

12/10/09 09CV0370 McClellan 936 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00

09CV0328 Miller 356 West Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio $44,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0418 Newland 348 Riverside Dr. Tiffin, Ohio N/A $-00

12/10/09 09CV0428 Scott 243 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio $25,000.00 Plaintiff $16,667.00

12/10/09 08CV0558 Tyson 631 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $14,000.00 Plaintiff $9,334.00
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09CV0430 Wilhelm 112 Cherry Street, Tiffin, Ohio $-00 N/A $-00

12/10/09 09CV0398 Winslow 2 Lovers Lane, Bloomville, Ohio $95,000.00 Plaintiff $63,333.00

12/10/09 09CV0330 Wise, Jr. 15818 East County Road 8, Attica, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00

09CV0378 Wolph 1220 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio $51,000.00 N/A $-00

12/10/09 09CV0210 Zender 525 Bulger Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio $24,000.00 Plaintiff $16,000.00

01/07/10 09CV0459 Angus 237 State Street, Bettsville, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00

01/07/10 09CV0507 Biddle 2207 South State Route 587, New Riegel, 
Ohio

$80,000.00 Plaintiff $53,333.33

09CV0364 Bryan 136 Seneca Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio $30,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0491 Caswell II 348 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio $85,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0488 Cruikshanks 114 Sycamore Street, Tiffin, Ohio $160,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0496 Daughenbaugh 133 Fall Street, Fostoria, Ohio $26,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0404 Digby/Huffman 107 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio $44,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0477 Dorsey 306 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio $66,000.00 N/A $-00

01/07/10 09CV0304 Fearing 27 Barcelona Drive, Fostoria, Ohio $82,000.00 Plaintiff $61,000.00

01/07/10 09CV0446 Fuerstanau 1047 State Street, Fostoria, Ohio $30,000.00 Plaintiff $20,000.00

01/07/10 08CV0131 Huppy's West Lodi Bar 2747 County Road 27, Bellevue, Ohio $49,000.00 Plaintiff $32,667.00
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01/07/10 09CV0407 Niswander 351 West Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio $33,000.00 Plaintiff $22,000.00

01/07/10 08CV2010 Pinkston 981 Morgan Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $120,000.00 Plaintiff $80,000.00

09CV0520 Rinaman, III 49 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio $45,000.00 N/A $-00

08CV0462 Ritter 505 East Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio N/A $-00

08CV0579 Seneca Recycle and Disposal, 
Inc.

72 and 78 Adams Street, Tiffin, Ohio N/A $-00

01/07/10 08CV0428 Stearns 339 West North Street, Fostoria, Ohio $50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00

01/07/10 09CV0484 Thebeau 1207 Forty-Second Street, Fostoria, Ohio $50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,333.33

01/07/10 09CV0148 Trausch 611 East Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio $37,000.00 Plaintiff $24,667.00

09CV0380 Wolph 845 Cory Street, Fostoria, Ohio $45,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0393 Altenburger 2621 South State Route 100, Tiffin, Ohio $152,000.00 N/A $-00

01/21/10 08CV0266 Bailey 85 Mohawk Street, Tiffin, Ohio $33,000.00 Richard A. Kahler $22,000.00

01/21/10 09CV0478 Baker 335 West Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00

01/21/10 08CV0652 Bauer 6743 North State Route 18, Clyde, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $45,000.00

09CV0512 Cardwell 912 Walnut Street, Fostoria, Ohio $48,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0360 Evans 139 East Center Street, Fostoria, Ohio $36,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0376 Gillian 515 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio $36,000.00 N/A $-00
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01/21/10 09CV0289 Hoover 20 Howard Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $63,000.00 Plaintiff $48,500.00

01/21/10 09CV0377 Kuhn 912 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio $33,000.00 Plaintiff $22,000.00

01/21/10 08CV0640 Miller dba Miller's Towing 0 East New Haven, Bloomville, Ohio $25,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00

01/21/10 06CV0587 Moser 109 South Woodwind Drive, Attica, Ohio $70,000.00 Plaintiff $46,667.00

01/21/10 09CV0130 Mount 190 Third Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $52,000.00 Plaintiff $34,666.67

06CV0465 Rhodes 368 Perry Street, Fostoria, Ohio N/A $-00

01/21/10 09CV0337 Smelser 9040 Township Road 36, Kansas, Ohio $28,000.00 Plaintiff $31,100.00

01/21/10 09CV0264 Vitte 148 East Eagle Street, Fostoria, Ohio $65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00

01/21/10 08CV0431 Young 3050 North County Road 11, Tiffin, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $88,800.00

02/04/10 09CV0498 Cameron, Jr. 140 First Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $62,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00

02/04/10 09CV0336 Carrillo 46 Oakbridge Park, Tiffin, Ohio $300,000.00 Kyle M. Smith and Bridget A. 
Vera-Smith, joint tenants with 
rights of survivorship

$366,000.00

02/04/10 09CV0313 Evans 7411 North County Road 5, Fostoria, Ohio $62,000.00 Plaintiff $43,000.00

02/04/10 09CV0523 Fatzinger 204 First Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $38,000.00 Plaintiff $53,916.06

07CV0103 Hartson 6375 West Country Road 6, New Riegel, Ohio $26,000.00 N/A $-00

02/04/10 09CV0440 Hasselback 2856 County Road 27, Bellevue, Ohio $58,000.00 Plaintiff $38,667.00

09CV0412 Kwiatkowski 116 East State Street, Bettsville, Ohio $55,000.00 N/A $-00



Date of
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08CV0579 Seneca Recycle and Disposal, 
Inc.

72 & 78 Adams Street, Tiffin, Ohio $130,000.00 N/A $-00

02/04/10 09CV0467 Strong 410 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio $48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00

09CV0486 Thomas 151 East Clark Street, Fostoria, Ohio $20,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0245 Burks 1415 North Townshio Road 21, Fostoria, Ohio $31,000.00 N/A $-00

02/18/10 09CV0572 Fry 429 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio $50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00

02/18/10 09CV0474 Grummel & Remmele 
Properties, LTD

94 and 96 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 
Ohio

$105,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00

08CV0133 Sherck 209 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $72,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0547 Strobel 228 Hudson Street, Tiffin, Ohio $66,000.00 N/A $-00

02/18/10 09CV0261 Thompson 2470 North County Road 60, Fostoria, Ohio $75,000.00 Plaintiff $50,000.00

03/04/10 09CV0364 Bryan 136 Seneca Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio $30,000.00 Plaintiff $56,133.00

03/04/10 09CV0314 Clifton 188 Huss Street, Tiffin, Ohio $63,000.00 Plaintiff $42,000.00

09CV0599 Frishman 5167 South US Route 23, Alvada, Ohio $50,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0599 Frishman 5167 South US Route 23, Alvada, Ohio $50,000.00 N/A $-00

03/04/10 09CV0558 Holland 35 Nile Street, Tiffin, Ohio $74,000.00 Plaintiff $49,334.00

03/04/10 09CV0560 Moran 964 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio $58,000.00 Plaintiff $38,667.00

09CV0534 Owens 6425 North Township Road 1002, Fostoria, 
Ohio

$12,000.00 N/A $-00
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03/04/10 09CV0181 Rossi 7870 North State Route 18, Bellevue, Ohio $99,000.00 Plaintiff $66,000.00

03/04/10 09CV0535 Ruck, II 7708 Main Street, Flat Rock, Ohio $48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00

08CV0616 Thompson 248 East Crocker Street, Fostoria, Ohio $33,000.00 N/A $-00

03/04/10 09CV0602 Walter, Jr. 1101 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00

03/04/10 09CV0589 Wonder 631 Cherry Street, Fostoria, Ohio $22,000.00 Plaintiff $14,667.00

03/18/10 09CV0152 Agerter 524 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio $105,000.00 Plaintiff $70,000.00

03/18/10 09CV0538 Brose 334 Liberty Street, Fostoria, Ohio $35,000.00 Plaintiff $23,334.00

09CV0491 Caswell, II 348 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio $85,000.00 N/A $-00

03/18/10 09CV0518 Comer 401 Miami Street, Tiffin, Ohio $51,000.00 Plaintiff $34,000.00

03/18/10 09CV0496 Daughenbaugh 133 Fall Street, Fostoria, Ohio $26,000.00 Plaintiff $17,334.00

03/18/10 09CV0566 Grine, Jr. 262 Charlotte Street, Tiffin, Ohio $48,000.00 Plaintiff $65,950.51

03/18/10 09CV0536 Huffman 85 Gibson Court, Tiffin, Ohio $125,000.00 Plaintiff $83,334.00

03/18/10 09CV0537 Nieset 248 Wentz Street, Tiffin, Ohio $65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00

03/18/10 09CV0158 O'Millian 71 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio $66,000.00 Plaintiff $44,000.00

03/18/10 08CV0427 Saxton 65 Northview Drive, Tiffin, Ohio $108,000.00 Plaintiff $72,000.00

09CV0395 Tackett, Jr. 7948 West County Road 59, Adrian, Ohio $82,000.00 N/A $-00



Date of
Sale

Case No Defendant Legal Address Appraisal
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03/18/10 09CV0107 Wallace 1300 West County Road 6, Lot O, Tiffin, Ohio $53,000.00 Plaintiff $55,125.00

03/18/10 09CV0608 Zahn 172 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio $89,000.00 Plaintiff $59,334.00

04/01/10 09CV0510 Allen/Nye 7166 South County Road 19, Tiffin, Ohio $80,000.00 Plaintiff $53,334.00

09CV0632 Bernal 1110 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $59,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0346 Brommer, Jr. 3478 South State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio $99,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0100 Burwell 5091 E. US Route 224, Tiffin, Ohio N/A $-00

04/01/10 09CV0498 Cameron, Jr. 140 First Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $62,000.00 Esther M. Chaney $41,334.00

04/01/10 09CV0628 Cook 320 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00

04/01/10 09CV0625 Cooper 8829 West County Road 18, Fostoria, Ohio $27,000.00 Plaintiff $18,000.00

04/01/10 09CV0575 Davis 320 West South Street, Fostoria, Ohio $44,000.00 Plaintiff $29,334.00

04/01/10 09CV0583 Dean 7153 North County Road 5, Fostoria, Ohio $71,000.00 Plaintiff $47,334.00

04/01/10 09CV0236 Harper 294 Noble Street, Tiffin, Ohio $45,000.00 Plaintiff $30,000.00

04/01/10 09CV0576 Herman, Jr. 795 South County Road 17, Tiffin, Ohio $150,000.00 Plaintiff $100,000.00

09CV0577 Keefe 178 Erie Street, Tiffin, Ohio $33,000.00 N/A $-00

04/01/10 09CV0614 Manus 110 South Main Street, Attica, Ohio $39,000.00 Plaintiff $26,000.00

09CV0636 Ray 338 West High Street, Fostoria, Ohio $65,000.00 N/A $-00



Date of
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04/01/10 09CV0300 Rose 11340 East County Road 62, Green Springs, 
Ohio

$105,000.00 Plaintiff $70,000.00

04/01/10 09CV0565 Schockley 2295 West County Road 52, Tiffin, Ohio $230,000.00 Plaintiff $200,000.00

04/01/10 09CV0344 Sterling 224 Hall Street, Tiffin, Ohio $73,000.00 Plaintiff $48,667.00

09CV0662 Tackett 312 West Culbertson Street, Fostoria, Ohio $44,000.00 N/A $-00

04/01/10 09CV0627 Tuttle 5293 East Township Road 138, Tiffin, Ohio $96,000.00 Plaintiff $66,000.00

09CV0682 Amposta 452 South Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio $69,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0002 Bordner 206 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio $93,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0100 Burwell 5091 E. US Route 224, Tiffin, Ohio N/A $-00

04/15/10 09CV0544 Cook 841 Columbus Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio $23,000.00 Plaintiff $38,000.00

04/15/10 09CV0650 Feindel 1581 North Township Road 101, Fostoria, 
Ohio

$50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00

04/15/10 09CV0085 Lucius 3015 South County Road 591, Tiffin, Ohio $118,000.00 No Bid No Sale $-00

04/15/10 09CV0466 Shaferly 154 Cottage Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $45,000.00 Plaintiff $30,000.00

08CV0552 Sheridan/Lanker 144 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio $40,000.00 N/A $-00

04/15/10 09CV0547 Stroble 228 Hudson Street, Tiffin, Ohio $66,000.00 Plaintiff $44,000.00

04/15/10 09CV0041 Trapp 164 Summit Street, Fostoria, Ohio $35,000.00 Plaintiff $62,268.59

05/13/10 10CV0020 Bell 78 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio $80,000.00 Plaintiff $53,334.00
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05/13/10 09CV0684 Bennington 6105 West Township Road 174, Kansas, Ohio $28,000.00 Plaintiff $18,667.00

05/13/10 09CV0531 Brown 50 Noble Street, Tiffin, Ohio $59,000.00 Plaintiff $39,334.00

09CV0655 Brown 8240 Township Road 1093, Carey, Ohio $15,000.00 N/A $-00

05/13/10 10CV0009 Carter 874 Cory Street, Fostoria, Ohio $45,000.00 Plaintiff $30,000.00

09CV0491 Casswell II 348 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio $85,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0007 Cavey 128 West Clark Street, Fostoria, Ohio $47,000.00 N/A $-00

05/13/10 09CV0626 Conrad 48 Scott Street, Tiffin, Ohio $65,000.00 Plaintiff $43,334.00

05/13/10 09CV0669 Cook 177 Fourth Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $54,000.00 Plaintiff $36,000.00

05/13/10 09CV0488 Cruikshanks 114 Sycamore Street, Tiffin, Ohio $160,000.00 Plaintiff $106,667.00

05/13/10 10CV0016 Ehresman 610 East Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio $220,000.00 Plaintiff $146,667.00

10CV0051 Ehresman 8 South Main Street, Attica, Ohio N/A $-00

09CV0421 Fortney 111 Liberty Street, Attica, Ohio $72,000.00 N/A $-00

05/13/10 10CV0066 Free 125 Second Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00

05/13/10 10CV0003 Grezlik 10323 East County Road 34, Green Springs, 
Ohio

$59,000.00 Plaintiff $39,333.33

10CV0060 Hale 35-37 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $90,000.00 N/A $-00

05/13/10 07CV0103 Hartson 6375 West County Road 6, New Riegel, Ohio $26,000.00 Plaintiff $21,000.00
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05/13/10 10CV0010 Herrig 346 North Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio $28,000.00 Plaintiff $18,667.00

05/13/10 09CV0412 Kwiatkowski 116 East State Street, Bettsville, Ohio $55,000.00 Plaintiff $75,360.00

05/13/10 10CV0023 Matthews 114 East Tecumseh Drive, Tiffin, Ohio $120,000.00 Plaintiff $80,000.00

05/13/10 10CV0031 Navarro 489 Columbus Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio $32,000.00 Plaintiff $21,334.00

05/13/10 09CV0639 Neeley 293 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio No Bid No Sale $-00

05/13/10 09CV0534 Owens 6425 North Township Road 1002, Fostoria, 
Ohio

$12,000.00 Plaintiff $8,000.00

05/13/10 10CV0052 R&S Diversified Contracting, Inc. 26 & 26 Rear North Main Street, Attica, Ohio $55,000.00 Plaintiff $36,667.00

05/13/10 09CV0683 Schleter 2891 West Township Road 92, Tiffin, Ohio $55,000.00 Plaintiff $39,600.00

05/13/10 09CV0642 Shoup 28 West New Haven Street, Bloomville, Ohio $40,000.00 Plaintiff $26,667.00

05/13/10 09CV0630 Smith 226 Third Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio $63,000.00 Plaintiff $115,080.14

05/13/10 09CV0609 Thoman 858 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio No Bid No Sale $-00

05/13/10 10CV0069 Werner 12975 West Township Road 56, Alvada, Ohio $75,000.00 Plaintiff $86,334.30

05/13/10 08CV2037 White 122 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio No Bid No Sale $-00

10CV0015 Winnick 113 Douglas Street, Tiffin, Ohio $77,000.00 N/A $-00

05/27/10 10CV0054 Bell 88 Tomb Street, Tiffin, Ohio $25,000.00 Thaddeus M. Kahler $18,000.00

10CV0072 Dunlap 4985 South Township Road 173, Bloomville, 
Ohio

N/A $-00
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05/27/10 10CV0035 Everhart 385 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio $40,000.00 Plaintiff $26,667.00

05/27/10 10CV0097 Feasel 261 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio $40,000.00 Plaintiff $45,380.35

09CV0618 Geiser 6543 North County Road 5, Fostoria, Ohio $75,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0027 Green 310 Monroe Street, Bettsville, Ohio $59,000.00 N/A $-00

05/27/10 09CV0474 Grummel & Remmele Properties 94 and 96 South Washington Street, Tiffin, 
Ohio

No Bid No Sale $-00

05/27/10 08CV0144 Lucius 125 West High Street, Fostoria, Ohio $59,000.00 Plaintiff $39,334.00

05/27/10 08CV0144 Lucius 316 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio $42,000.00 Plaintiff $28,000.00

05/27/10 09CV0591 Mogle 448 Wall Street, Tiffin, Ohio $71,000.00 Plaintiff $47,334.00

05/27/10 09CV0639 Neeley 293 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio No Bid No Sale $-00

05/27/10 10CV0128 Oldaker 322 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio $18,000.00 Plaintiff $12,000.00

05/27/10 10CV0018 Omlor 47 Gail Lane, Tiffin, Ohio $78,000.00 Plaintiff $52,000.00

05/27/10 10CV0040 Preble 663 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio $17,000.00 Plaintiff $11,333.33

10CV0068 Slemmer 225 South Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio $90,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0101 Smith 579 Miami Street, Tiffin, Ohio $69,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0119 Studrawa 10575 West Millin Drive, Fostoria, Ohio $94,000.00 N/A $-00

05/27/10 09CV0609 Thoman 858 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio No Bid No Sale $-00
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09CV0267 Weller 12605 Township Road 178, Bellevue, Ohio N/A $-00

05/27/10 08CV2037 White 122 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio No Bid No Sale $-00

06/10/10 09CV0590 Hammer 344 North Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio $26,000.00 Plaintiff $17,334.00

10CV0154 Hartley 8054 Fort Street, Old Fort, Ohio $50,000.00 N/A $-00

06/10/10 09CV0275 Magill 119 Coe Street, Tiffin, Ohio $76,000.00 Plaintiff $50,667.00

10CV0113 Mendoza 12994 West County Road 28, Fostoria, Ohio $3,000.00 N/A $-00

06/10/10 09CV0635 Porter 286 Melmore Street, Tiffin, Ohio $98,000.00 Plaintiff $70,000.00

06/10/10 10CV0032 Reed 7462 North State Route 19, Green Springs, 
Ohio

$80,000.00 Plaintiff $68,895.20

10CV0135 Rohrbach 2369 South County Road 19, Tiffin, Ohio $81,000.00 N/A $-00

06/10/10 10CV0062 Sallisbury 901 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio $29,000.00 Plaintiff $19,334.00

06/10/10 10CV0137 Schalk 91 Sycamore Street, Tiffin, Ohio $85,000.00 Plaintiff $56,667.00

06/10/10 10CV0115 Soski 8315 North State Route 18, Bellevue, Ohio $51,000.00 Plaintiff $34,000.00

06/10/10 10CV0082 Whiteman 1651 South Duchess Lane, Tiffin, Ohio $40,000.00 Plaintiff $26,667.00

10CV0146 Wilhelm 5668 East County Road 16, Tiffin, Ohio $90,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0091 Williams 270 Greenfield Street, Tiffin, Ohio $63,000.00 N/A $-00

06/24/10 10CV0177 Armon 232 East Tiffin Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $20,000.00 Plaintiff $56,148.29
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06/24/10 10CV0179 Armon 304 East Tiffin Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $22,000.00 Plaintiff $57,793.89

10CV0158 Bowlin 324 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $88,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0346 Brommer, Jr. 3478 South State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $99,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0070 Burns 126 South Washington Street, Tiffin, Ohio 
44883

$55,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0070 Burns 671 South Washington Street, Tiffin, Ohio 
44883

$115,000.00 N/A $-00

06/24/10 09CV0231 DeMars 203 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $69,000.00 Plaintiff $46,000.00

06/24/10 10CV0118 Dessausure 856 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $10,000.00 Plaintiff $10,000.00

10CV0051 Ehresman 8 South Main Street, Attica, Ohio 44807 $40,000.00 N/A $-00

06/24/10 09CV0432 Everetts 310 and 308 State Street, Bettsville, Ohio 
44815

$6,000.00 Plaintiff $6,000.00

06/24/10 10CV0117 Frias 321 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $35,000.00 Plaintiff $23,334.00

06/24/10 09CV0599 Frishman 5167 South US Route 23, Alvada, Ohio 44802 $50,000.00 Plaintiff $33,334.00

10CV0114 Hardesty 85 Eighth Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $45,000.00 N/A $-00

09CV0440 Hasselbach 2856 County Road 27, Bellevue, Ohio 44811 $58,000.00 N/A $-00

06/24/10 09CV0621 Keck 304 South Broadway Street, Green Springs, 
Ohio 44836

No Bid No Sale $-00

10CV0198 Klingshirn 51 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $49,000.00 N/A $-00

06/24/10 08CV0640 Miller 0 East New Haven, Bloomville, Ohio 44818 Sanford I. Mullins $5,300.00
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06/24/10 10CV0014 Ortiz 830 Cory Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $43,000.00 Plaintiff $28,667.00

06/24/10 09CV0633 Saddlemire, Jr. 5773 N. Township Road 175, Republic, Ohio 
44867

Hiram B. Smith $10,800.00

06/24/10 08CV0429 Sloma 111 Washington Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815 $28,000.00 Plaintiff $18,667.00

06/24/10 10CV0071 Steinmetz 3166 North County Road 11, Tiffin, Ohio 
44883

$150,000.00 Plaintiff $100,000.00

07/08/10 10CV0155 Best 241 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $75,000.00 Plaintiff $50,000.00

10CV0166 Fitch 149 Ohio Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00

07/08/10 09CV0657 Fowler 74 Elmer Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $60,000.00 Plaintiff $40,000.00

07/08/10 10CV0226 Hanson 842 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $35,000.00 Donna R Harris $24,000.00

07/08/10 09CV0621 Keck 304 South Broadway Street, Green Springs, 
Ohio 44836

No Bid/No Sale $-00

07/08/10 10CV0192 Kohlenberg 104 Wilson Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815 $23,000.00 Plaintiff $15,334.00

07/08/10 09CV0224 Laird Block, LLC 120 South Washington Street, Tiffin, Ohio 
44883

$400,000.00 Plaintiff $266,667.00

10CV0167 Lowery 16120 East Township Road 104, Attica, Ohio 
44807

$65,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0110 McGee 524 East Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $27,000.00 N/A $-00

08CV0640 Miller 0 East New Haven, Bloomville, Ohio 44818 Sold on June 24, 2010

07/08/10 10CV0089 Morrow 179 Sixth Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $61,000.00 Plaintiff $91,993.53

07/08/10 10CV0102 Province 536 Miami Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $98,000.00 Plaintiff $65,334.00
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09CV0633 Saddlemire, Jr. 5773 N. Township Road 175, Republic, Ohio 
44867

Sold on June 24, 2010

07/08/10 09CV0169 Ward, Jr. 750 Circle Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $54,000.00 Plaintiff $36,000.00

09CV0682 Amposta 452 South Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $69,000.00 N/A $-00

07/22/10 10CV0043 Bolden 521 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 No Bid No Sale $-00

09CV0655 Brown 8240 McCutchen, Carey, OH  43316 aka 
8240 TR 93, Carey, OH 43316

N/A $-00

10CV0042 Burwell 76 Schonhardt Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00

07/22/10 10CV0027 Green I 310 Monroe Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815 $59,000.00 Plaintiff $39,334.00

10CV0127 Hackenburg 122 Park Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00

07/22/10 10CV0133 Headrick 106 Melmore Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $52,000.00 Plaintiff $34,667.00

09CV0315 Helkey 35 Huss Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 N/A $-00

09CV0085 Lucius 3015 South County Road 591, Tiffin, Ohio 
44883

$70,000.00 N/A $-00

07/22/10 09CV0671 Paradiso 160 South Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 The Old Fort Banking 
Company

$30,000.00

07/22/10 10CV0136 Reinhard 243 West Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $26,000.00 Plaintiff $17,334.00

08CV0462 Ritter 505 East Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830 $27,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0176 Rohe 55 East New Haven Street, Bloomville, Ohio 
44818

$30,000.00 N/A $-00

07/22/10 10CV0055 Sayre 0 West County Road 62, Bettsville, Ohio 
44815

Donald A. Hammer $5,688.48
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10CV0068 Slemmer 225 South Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $90,000.00 N/A $-00

07/22/10 10CV0202 Smith 182 Charlotte Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883 $48,000.00 Plaintiff $32,000.00

10CV0059 Wertz 3221 West County Road 38, Tiffin, Ohio 
44883

$18,000.00 N/A $-00

10CV0141 Zorn 8561 South Township Road 171, Bloomville, 
Ohio 44818

$190,000.00 N/A $-00


