

Past Sheriff Sale List

Friday, October 26, 2012

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
01/06/11	10CV0363	Bowes	826 East County Road 40, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$87,000.00	\$58,000.00	Plaintiff	\$58,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/06/11	08CV0500	Colgate	459 South Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	R Investments, LLC	\$43,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0407	Cupples	5726 North State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
01/06/11	09CV0010	Glass City Sales, LLC	108 Woodland, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,804.08	Team HB LLC	\$10,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0365	Heater	423 North State Route 587, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0510	Heck	93 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
01/06/11	09CV0519	Paugh	229 East Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00	Malcolm F and Yvonne L. Beck	\$10,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0516	Tiell	5991 North State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
01/06/11	08CV0550	Traxler	106 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	Plaintiff	\$50,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/06/11	10CV0256	Wohlgamuth	8490 North Township Road 1166, Betsville, Ohio 44815	\$65,000.00	\$43,334.00	Plaintiff	\$43,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/06/11	10CV0442	Young	105 Broadway Street, Republic, Ohio 44867	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	Ethan J. Hoepf	\$40,100.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	06CV0526	Young	3640 North Township Road 47, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,326.78		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0057	Betz	302 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,685.28	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
	10CV0422	Bryant	24 Webster Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	09CV0010	Glass City Sales, LLC	108 Woodland, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,804.08	See January 6, 2011 sale list	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
01/20/11	10CV0527	Grimes	43 Minerva Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/20/11	10CV0458	Lindsey	633 Maple Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	Plaintiff	\$23,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
01/20/11	10CV0532	Robinette	608 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$41,000.00	\$27,334.00	Plaintiff	\$27,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	09CV0493	Stewart Jr.	13235 East County Road 58, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
01/20/11	10CV0295	Vest	206 Thomas Street, Bettsville, Ohio 44815	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	Plaintiff	\$16,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0059	Wertz	3221 West County Road 38, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$18,000.00	\$12,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	08CV2054	Borton	42 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$7,186.87	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
02/03/11	10CV0508	Chase	201 East Adams Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	Plaintiff	\$32,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
02/03/11	10CV0491	Dosh	312 S. Main Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
02/03/11	10CV0368	Zender	410 North Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$29,000.00	\$19,334.00	Plaintiff	\$19,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	08CV2054	Borton	42 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$7,186.87	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
02/17/11	10CV0502	Earle	105 Catherine Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836	\$81,000.00	\$54,000.00	Plaintiff	\$54,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
02/17/11	10CV0404	Klotz	1140 N Township Road 21, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$50,000.00	\$33,334.00	Plaintiff	\$33,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
02/17/11	10CV0081	Lee	10855 W Township Road 41, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$45,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0225	Meddles	639 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/03/11	10CV0551	Brown	536 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$41,000.00	\$27,334.00	Plaintiff	\$27,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0580	Burks	1415 Township Road 21 North, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/03/11	10CV0080	Keefer	518-518 1/2 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/03/11	10CV0500	Langley	60 Hall Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	Plaintiff	\$96,317.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0606	Meisner	4272 East Township Road 130, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/03/11	10CV0501	Merrick	219 Summit Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/03/11	10CV0587	Parks	1010 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$52,000.00	\$34,667.00	Plaintiff	\$34,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0422	Bryant	24 Webster Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0060	Hale	35-37 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/17/11	10CV0386	Kraft	319 N Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	Plaintiff	\$50,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0530	Lofay	266 Wentz Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883			N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
03/17/11	10CV0602	Moyer	1556 West County Road 38, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	Plaintiff	\$60,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/17/11	10CV0421	Moyer	255 East South Trail, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	09CV0493	Stewart, Jr.	13235 East County Road 58, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/17/11	10CV0485	Williams, Jr.	270 Greenfield Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	Plaintiff	\$44,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0609	Blausey	150 State Route 4, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
03/31/11	10CV0590	Dillon	244 Sycamore Street, Fostoria Ohio 44830	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	Plaintiff	\$22,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/31/11	10CV0021	Hay	731 Circle Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$13,000.00	\$8,667.00	R.A. Zeis Builders Inc.	\$9,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/31/11	10CV0393	Hohman	7381 North Township Road 63, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$42,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/31/11	10CV0585	Klotz	8939 North State Route 590, Bettsville, Ohio 44815	\$61,000.00	\$40,667.00	Plaintiff	\$40,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/31/11	10CV0447	Lynch, Trustee	7161 West State Route 12, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$55,000.00	\$36,667.00	Plaintiff	\$36,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/31/11	10CV0499	Osterwalder, Trustee	3785 North State Route 53, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	Edward Correll	\$77,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
03/31/11	10CV0290	Payne	228 East Tiffin Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$26,000.00	\$17,334.00	Plaintiff	\$18,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/14/11	10CV0610	Page	852 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$10,000.00	\$6,667.00	Plaintiff	\$6,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/14/11	11CV0004	Rinaman, III	49 Longfellow Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	Plaintiff	\$28,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
04/14/11	10CV0302	Salazar	306 Kennard Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$40,000.00	\$26,667.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/14/11	10CV0344	Summers	9762 East Township Road 58, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$42,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
04/28/11	11CV0028	Conlin	317 West Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	Plaintiff	\$32,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0568	Hall	238 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
04/28/11	10CV0641	Hook	267 Fourth Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	09CV0584	Keefe	75 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0198	Klingshirn	51 Jackson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$49,000.00	\$32,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0385	Mabry	57 Grace Street, Tiffin, Ohio 4883	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
04/28/11	10CV0611	Panuto	424 South Monroe Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	Plaintiff	\$46,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0074	Parks	321 Sumner Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$59,000.00	\$39,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0550	Tiell	279 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	10CV0515	Balderson	10310 West Township Road 84, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$5,000.00	\$3,334.00	Plaintiff	\$12,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	10CV0580	Burks	1415 Township Road 21 North, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	Plaintiff	\$99,368.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0060	Hale	35-37 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$90,000.00	\$60,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
05/12/11	10CV0601	Hooven	165 East Center Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$19,398.03	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	10CV0416	Lira	625 Maple Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$5,000.00	\$3,334.00	Plaintiff	\$10,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	10CV0486	McGown	27 Apple Street, Tiffin Ohio 44883	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	Plaintiff	\$44,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	10CV0388	Nedolast	9 Grammes Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	Plaintiff	\$36,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	10CV0598	Nungester	642 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$14,290.11	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0053	Pace	421 West Culbertson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$42,500.00	\$28,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	11CV0038	Shoup	106 Rear West High Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Robert & Kristina Shumaker	\$31,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	11CV0020	Sklar	21 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/12/11	09CV0493	Stewart Jr.	13235 East County Road 58, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	11CV0029	Anderson	406 North Main Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	Plaintiff	\$32,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0586	Bernal	926 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830			N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0629	Corliss	154 East Township Road 1178, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$10,951.76	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	11CV0013	Faith in Christ Tab.	33 Venice Street, Attica, Ohio 44807		\$7,161.49	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	10CV0593	Fortney	343 West Perry Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	Plaintiff	\$38,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
05/26/11	11CV0059	Garcia	847 Spruce Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$29,000.00	\$19,334.00	Plaintiff	\$19,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	10CV0625	Hamilton	2460 North County Road 27 (Seneca East LSD), Attica, Ohio 44807		\$8,189.28	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	11CV0075	Hartzel	269 Main Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	10CV0601	Hooven	165 East Center Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$19,398.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	10CV0530	Lofay	266 Wentz Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$42,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0012	Mendez	399 Fall Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,424.08	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	10CV0367	Mosier	508 South Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$43,000.00	\$28,667.00	Plaintiff	\$28,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	10CV0598	Nungester	642 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$14,290.11	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
05/26/11	11CV0032	Welborn	230 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	Plaintiff	\$16,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	10CV0592	Aaro	276 South Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	Plaintiff	\$36,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0629	Corliss	154 East Township Road 1178, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$10,951.76	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	11CV0013	Faith in Christ Tab.	33 Venice Street, Attica, Ohio 44807		\$7,161.49	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	10CV0273	Giblin	708 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$75,000.00	\$60,000.00	Presidio Homes LLC	\$60,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	10CV0625	Hamilton	2460 North County Road 27 (Seneca East LSD), Attica, Ohio 44807		\$8,189.28	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
06/09/11	11CV0073	Hausman	200 North Washington Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	Plaintiff	\$48,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	08CV0403	James	417 Beech Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$37,000.00	\$24,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0012	Mendez	399 Fall Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,424.08	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	10CV0507	Robbins	280-280 1/2 South Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	Plaintiff	\$48,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	11CV0058	Snyder	735 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$52,000.00	\$34,667.00	Plaintiff	\$34,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	09CV0557	Tiffin Downtown Dev.	92 South Washington, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0650	Waltermyer, II	102 McDonel Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/09/11	10CV0567	Williams	43 Beechwood Drive, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$117,000.00	\$78,000.00	Plaintiff	\$78,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/23/11	10CV0633	Bercaw	316 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$29,000.00	\$19,334.00	Plaintiff	\$19,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0422	Bryant	24 Webster Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0068	Cox	22 Noble Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0476	Macbeth	111 Seneca Street, Attica, OH 44807	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0571	Montgomery	258 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/23/11	10CV0623	Sherman	3558 West County Road 62, Bettsville, Ohio 44815		\$9,752.55	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
	11CV0108	Shiley	444 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$50,000.00	\$33,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
06/23/11	11CV0083	Stander	8536 South State Route 19, Bloomville, Ohio 44818		\$6,311.92	Andrew H. Kinn	\$7,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
06/23/11	10CV0639	Swartz	424 North Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$20,000.00	\$13,334.00	Plaintiff	\$13,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	11CV0113	Adams	21 Maple Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$42,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	10CV0057	Betz	176 Fifth Avenue, Tiffin Ohio 44883		\$8,913.61	No Bid No Sale - First Sale Date	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	10CV0057	Betz	302 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,752.17	No Bid No Sale - First Sale Date	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	10CV0628	Hohman, Sr.	203 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$7,739.36	no Bid No Sale - First Sale Date	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0078	Kaufman	12 Towne & Country, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$120,000.00	\$80,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0341	Kiser	49 Douglas Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	10CV0623	Sherman	3558 West County Road 62, Bettsville, Ohio 44815		\$9,752.55	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	10CV0493	Smith	247 1st Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0083	Stander	8536 South State Route 19, Bloomville, Ohio 44818		\$6,311.92		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	11CV0030	Stump	0 Cherry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$2,874.02	No Bid No Sale - First Sale Date	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	11CV0030	Stump	1115 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,888.75	No Bid No Sale - First Sale Date	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
07/07/11	11CV0010	Turner	10246 West Township Road 84, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$50,000.00	\$33,334.00	Plaintiff	\$45,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/07/11	10CV0093	Wilson	114 East Clark Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/21/11	10CV0057	Betz	302 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,752.17	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/21/11	10CV0057	Betz	176 Fifth Avenue, Tiffin Ohio 44883		\$8,913.61	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/21/11	10CV0628	Hohman, Sr.	203 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$7,739.36	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/21/11	10CV0652	Hossler	2169 North County Road 15, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/21/11	11CV0030	Stump	0 Cherry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$2,874.02	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/21/11	11CV0030	Stump	1115 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,888.75	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
07/21/11	10CV0059	Wertz	3221 West County Road 38, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$18,000.00	\$12,000.00	Plaintiff	\$12,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	10CV0645	Beckley	37 Second Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	11CV0203	Drown	251 Ohio Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$48,000.00	\$32,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	11CV0007	Funk, Jr.	205-211 Sandusky, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$20,000.00	\$13,334.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	10CV0568	Hall	238 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	Plaintiff	\$50,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0142	Harper	2124 North Township Road 69 and 0 Township Road 132, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
	11CV0194	Harple	217 Hudson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$70,000.00	\$46,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	08CV0073	Harrison	351 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$6,656.08	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	11CV0129	Houghton	212 East Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	Plaintiff	\$48,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	10CV0448	Legron	1300 J West County Road 6, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	10CV0498	Pahl	605 South Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$31,000.00	\$20,667.00	Plaintiff	\$20,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/04/11	11CV0074	Parks/Teleha	321 Sumner Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$59,000.00	\$39,334.00	Plaintiff	\$39,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0564	Rhodes	368 Perry Street, Fostoria Ohio 44830	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0126	Schwab, III	2589 South Township Road 1189, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$198,000.00	\$132,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
08/18/11	10CV0253	Ambrose	3560 West Township Road 158, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/18/11	08CV0073	Harrison	351 Water Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$6,656.08	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/18/11	11CV0057	Jordan	15687 East Township Road 124, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$93,000.00	\$62,000.00	Plaintiff	\$62,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/18/11	10CV0554	Kinn	261 First Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	Plaintiff	\$36,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/18/11	11CV0141	Kiser	3017 East County Road 50, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	Plaintiff	\$66,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/18/11	10CV0571	Montgomery	258 West Tiffin Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
08/18/11	11CV0119	Rohrbach	71 Front Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$81,000.00	\$54,000.00	Plaintiff	\$54,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
08/18/11	11CV0177	Walland	430 East Market Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$42,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	11CV0152	Ash	225 East Crocker Street, Fostoria Ohio 44830	\$12,000.00	\$8,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	07CV0659	Columber	307 West Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$7,311.91	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	10CV0432	Fortney	733 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$65,000.00	\$43,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0086	Herrera	4185 North County Road 31, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	11CV0060	Hossler	725 South Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	Plaintiff	\$22,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	10CV0041	Martin	72 Charlotte Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$12,000.00	\$8,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	11CV0014	May	739 Cherry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,754.63	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	11CV0079	Osmer	22 South High Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$42,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	11CV0190	Rosales	525 McDougal Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	10CV0550	Tiell	279 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	10CV0588	VJA Tiffin LLC	225 Mohawk, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$101,296.10	Aaron M. Herbert	\$400,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/01/11	10CV0588	VJA Tiffin LLC	0 Mohawk, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$4,062.80	N/A	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
09/15/11	11CV0040	Alley	334 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,244.53	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	07CV0659	Columber	307 West Jackson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$7,311.91	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	10CV0222	Cooper	155 East Fourth Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$25,000.00	\$16,667.00	Plaintiff	\$36,937.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	11CV0026	Guerra	104 Diehl Road, Bettsville, Ohio 44815	\$10,000.00	\$6,667.00	Plaintiff	\$6,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	09CV0440	Hasselbach	2856 County Road 27, Bellevue, Ohio 44811	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	11CV0014	May	739 Cherry Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,754.63	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	11CV0053	Pace	421 West Culbertson Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$42,500.00	\$28,334.00	Plaintiff	\$28,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	11CV0186	Prenzlin	145 Rock Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	11CV0160	Smith	1738 North State Route 101, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$46,709.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0588	VJA Tiffin LLC	0 Mohawk, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$4,062.80		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0588	VJA Tiffin LLC	225 Mohawk, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$101,296.10		\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/15/11	11CV0224	Zeiter	725 Oaklawn Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$26,000.00	\$17,334.00	Plaintiff	\$17,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	11CV0040	Alley	334 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,244.53	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	10CV0381	Burns	259 Noble Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
	11CV0232	Cardwell	51 Maplewood Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	11CV0273	Clark	12551 West Wagner Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Jason M Curlis	\$62,200.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	11CV0035	Dendinger	11367 E TR 148, Republic, Ohio 44867		\$7,931.85	The Republic Banking Co.	\$17,600.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	11CV0044	Go Invest Wisely	253 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,750.08	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	11CV0216	Kauffman	12626 West Township Road 56, Alvada, Ohio 44802	\$40,000.00	\$26,667.00	Plaintiff	\$26,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	11CV0043	Mitchell	671 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,502.22	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	10CV0605	Phipps	210 East Lytle, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	11CV0237	Poland	1001 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$40,000.00	\$26,667.00	Plaintiff	\$26,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
09/29/11	10CV0650	Waltermeyer, II	102 McDonel Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	Plaintiff	\$23,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	07CV0469	Yoder	624 Lexington Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$10,100.65	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0247	Church	78 East Tecumseh Trail, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$129,000.00	\$86,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0035	Dendinger	11367 E TR 148, Republic, Ohio 44867		\$7,931.85	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/13/11	11CV0044	Go Invest Wisely	253 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,750.08	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/13/11	11CV0043	Mitchell	671 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$6,502.22	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
	10CV0274	Sandstrom	304 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$5,000.00	\$3,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/13/11	11CV0126	Schwab, III	2589 South Township Road 1189, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$198,000.00	\$132,000.00	Plaintiff	\$148,940.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/13/11	11CV0095	Sheridan	156 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,007.26	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/13/11	11CV0095	Sheridan	0 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,320.60	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0293	Williams	219 Smith Street, Green Springs, Ohio 44836	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	07CV0469	Yoder	624 Lexington Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$10,100.65	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0152	Ash	225 East Crocker Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$12,000.00	\$8,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0235	Claburn	5874 Township Road 1016, Kansas, Ohio 44841	\$33,000.00	\$22,000.00	Plaintiff	\$22,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0285	Cook	801 South Main Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$60,000.00	\$40,000.00	Plaintiff	\$40,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	10CV0622	Dauterman	121 Myers Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$58,000.00	\$38,667.00	Plaintiff	\$38,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0298	Elchert	34 Sycamore Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	Plaintiff	\$26,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0081	Harris	0 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$3,053.49	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0081	Harris	347 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,614.15	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0305	House	168 Summit Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$50,000.00	\$33,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
10/27/11	08CV0441	Leimenstoll	0 Union Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$2,886.88	Douglas A. Reinhart	\$2,886.88	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	08CV0441	Leimenstoll	178 Union Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$7,106.79	Hiram B. Smith	\$21,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0476	Macbeth	111 North Seneca Street, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0295	Miller, Sr.	1021 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$19,000.00	\$12,667.00	Plaintiff	\$12,667.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0238	Palmerton	937 Leonard Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830			N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0095	Sheridan	156 Sandusky Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$8,007.26	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0095	Sheridan	0 East Fremont Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$1,320.60	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0079	Torres	429 North Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$38,000.00	\$25,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
10/27/11	11CV0170	Tyson	248 Rock Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$30,000.00	\$20,000.00	Plaintiff	\$20,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0432	Fortney	733 North Union Street, Fostoria, OH 44830	\$65,000.00	\$43,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
11/10/11	11CV0081	Harris	0 Lynn Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$3,053.49	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/10/11	11CV0081	Harris	347 East Jones Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$5,614.15	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	08CV0441	Leimenstoll	178 Union Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$7,106.79		\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	08CV0441	Leimenstoll	0 Union Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$2,886.88		\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
11/10/11	11CV0297	Strait	44 North Sandusky Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$75,000.00	\$50,000.00	Plaintiff	\$58,650.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/10/11	11CV0008	Swecker	1637 East Township Road 138, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$61,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/10/11	11CV0316	Thompson	608 Fifth Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/10/11	10CV0550	Tiell	279 Jefferson Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	Plaintiff	\$36,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
11/10/11	10CV0093	Wilson	114 East Clark Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$42,000.00	\$28,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0031	Am. Armature	980 Morgan Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$99,000.00	\$66,000.00	Plaintiff	\$66,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0332	Bailes, Sr.	2386 South Township Road 181, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$111,000.00	\$74,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0319	Banks	651 Northview Drive, Fostoria, Ohio 44830			N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0322	Bev & Jak's	3633 South State Route 4, Attica, Ohio 44807	\$63,000.00	\$42,000.00	Plaintiff	\$51,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0259	Brooks	15 Douglas Street and 0 Douglas Street, Bloomville, Ohio 44818	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	10CV0422	Bryant	24 Webster Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	Plaintiff	\$27,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	09CV0601	Bullock	301 East High Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$29,000.00	\$19,334.00	Plaintiff	\$19,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	10CV0150	Church	136 Bradner Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$36,000.00	\$24,000.00	Plaintiff	\$24,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0068	Cox	22 Noble Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$69,000.00	\$46,000.00	Plaintiff	\$46,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
12/08/11	11CV0203	Drown	251 Ohio Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,025.80	Wayne A. Kipps	\$20,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0239	Dukes	243 West Crocker Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0275	Geiser	6543 North County Road 5, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$57,000.00	\$38,000.00	Pamela Shumaker	\$51,500.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	10CV0284	Guenther	108 West Euclid Avenue, Green Springs, Ohio 44836	\$45,000.00	\$30,000.00	Plaintiff	\$30,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0060	Hale	35-37 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$87,000.00	\$58,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	10CV0505	Hanna	14 North Tecumseh Trail, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$171,000.00	\$114,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	10CV0298	Keiser	425 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$47,000.00	\$31,334.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0274	Kuhn	11787 West Township Road 112, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$40,000.00	\$26,667.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0229	Lynch	624 Woodward Avenue, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$39,000.00	\$26,000.00	Plaintiff	\$26,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	08CV0166	Martinez	1540 North Township Road 111, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,896.15	Randall Hoover	\$11,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0294	McBeth	600 South Union Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$15,000.00	\$10,000.00	Plaintiff	\$10,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0217	Miller	334 Clinton Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$51,000.00	\$34,000.00	Plaintiff	\$34,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0329	Musgrave	8476 South US Highway 23, Carey, Ohio 43316	\$72,000.00	\$48,000.00	Plaintiff	\$48,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0103	Niedbala	0 County Road 6 (at the corner of South Township Road 171), Section 25, Eden Township, Ohio	\$21,000.00	\$14,000.00	David Hohman	\$21,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
12/08/11	10CV0411	Pinkston	8035 North County Road 31, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$54,000.00	\$36,000.00	Plaintiff	\$36,000.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	10CV0274	Sandstrom	304 South Poplar Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$5,000.00	\$3,334.00	Plaintiff	\$3,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	11CV0108	Shiley	444 Union Court, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$50,000.00	\$33,334.00	Plaintiff	\$73,904.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/08/11	08CV0289	Tucker	420 North Town Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$38,000.00	\$25,334.00	Plaintiff	\$25,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	08CV0069	Wickham	2727 West US Highway 224, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$114,000.00	\$76,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	09CV0378	Wolph	1220 North Union, Fostoria, Ohio 44830-1922	\$47,000.00	\$31,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0287	Doran	949 Buckley Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$20,000.00	\$13,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0203	Drown	251 Ohio Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,025.80	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0284	Goddard	204 Elm Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0352	Gruss	208 North County Road 43, Republic, Ohio 44867	\$135,000.00	\$90,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/22/11	11CV0370	Harding	212 East North Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$20,000.00	\$13,334.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	08CV0166	Martinez	1540 North Township Road 111, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,896.15	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0015	Mullen	195 Front Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$126,000.00	\$84,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>
12/22/11	10CV0605	Phipps	210 East Lytle Street, Fostoria, Ohio 44830		\$27,000.00	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>

Date of Sale	Case No	Defendant	Legal Address	Appraisal Amount	Starting Bid	Purchaser	Purchase Price	Sale Cancelled
12/22/11	11CV0041	Shrewsbury	17 East Davis Street, Tiffin, Ohio 44883		\$5,682.44	No Bid No Sale	\$-00	<input type="checkbox"/>
12/22/11	10CV0589	Wolfelt	7543 North County Road 3, Fostoria, Ohio 44830	\$35,000.00	\$23,334.00	Plaintiff	\$23,334.00	<input type="checkbox"/>
	11CV0279	Wurm	160 Lindsay Avenue, Tiffin, Ohio 44883	\$66,000.00	\$44,000.00	N/A	\$-00	<input checked="" type="checkbox"/>